
The Recall Dream 11-16-24@ 5:55 AMWith Confirmation Updated 12-18-24

"I dreamed again my Lord Jesus Christ and I have prayed about it in Your Holy Name. I've
tried, tested, and discerned it. Now I'm here to write it out with sweet Holy Ghost Spirit's help.
Please don't let me write a word or make an assumption of my own. Again in Your Name Jesus
Christ my love I ask and pray." "I won't daughter of Mine." "Thank you my lovely Jesus Christ."
"You're welcome Daughter of Mine."

I found myself going into this dream knowing that there had been some type of large recalls on
food and other type items. I am inside what looks like an underground bunker of sorts. This area
in particular looks like some type of computer room or possibly even a command center of some
type. There are men and women dressed in military fatigues here. Some are sitting at the
computer terminals while others are doing various other things. Another man in army fatigue
comes striding purposefully into the room and begins speaking to the people in a voice of
authority.

"Listen up," he says, drawing every other person's attention to him. "We have been ordered to
stop the reserve and other bunkers. In addition we are to prepare for the auctioning of preferred
items of any surplus to those in the preferred circle of the elite. We will be focusing again on
major dairy products and meat. When they are recalled and returned the majority are to be
immediately sent to the underground facilities for the freeze drying process. The bunkers of the
upper elite, the presidential and legislative bodies, and military bunkers are to be stocked first.
Most are already fully stocked but requests have went in for preferred items."

"After these requirements are filled then we will auction the remaining amounts left after we
send an allotment to each underground city being prepared in advance of the nuclear
contamination that's inevitable in our above ground world. You know the drill. The procedure's
the same. Do not recall more than we can process. For these products use the e coli, listeria, and
others as the reasons they are to be recalled. The mislabeling has been very effective too.



https://www.today.com/health/recall/ground-beef-recall-e-coli-2024-rcna181171

https://www.fsis.usda.gov/recalls-alerts/wolverine-packing-co--recalls-ground-beef-products-due
-possible-e--coli-o157h7?os=Fpn4c7ikwkiNAAg&ref=app

https://www.cnn.com/2024/11/22/health/yu-shang-recall-listeria/index.html

https://www.wltx.com/article/news/verify/recalls-verify/south-carolina-meat-recall-expands-ami
d-deadly-listeria-outbreak/101-d24897b5-2129-4a28-9ce9-06e54db25d2d



https://www.yahoo.com/news/carrot-recall-list-every-store-191140038.html?fr=yhssrp_catchall

F&S Fresh Foods Recalls Whole Foods Market Organic Carrot Sticks and Organic Carrots &
Celery Because of Possible Health Risk Due to Potential E. coli Contamination | FDA

https://www.foodsafetynews.com/2024/11/cinnamon-powder-recalled-after-testing-finds-elevate
d-levels-of-lead/
https://www.eatingwell.com/walmart-recalled-popular-bakery-items-nationwide-8748632

https://www.ksnt.com/news/kansas/great-value-breakfast-food-products-recalled-due-to-plastic-c



ontamination/

https://www.fsis.usda.gov/recalls-alerts/fsis-issues-public-health-alert-ineligible-beef-tallow-pro
ducts-imported-mexico?permalink=B88BE6D7FDB2A31487475B7DBA8454FB6F8C4019EF5
F12BAA35F43B3CE9A44B3

https://www.wisfarmer.com/story/news/2024/11/20/uw-madisons-babcock-dairy-expands-recall-f
or-mislabeled-ice-cream/76451269007/

https://www.wkow.com/news/health/babock-dairy-expands-recall-on-some-ice-cream-products/a
rticle_41f56f0c-a69c-11ef-8e1b-03bdb6d14fb8.html#:~:text=Babcock%20Dairy%20is%20recall
ing%20Orange%20Custard%20Chocolate%20Chip,consume%20these%20products%2C%20acc
ording%20to%20a%20press%20release.



Endo Expands Voluntary Recall of Clonazepam Orally Disintegrating Tablets, USP (C-IV) Due
to Potential Product Carton Strength Mislabeling | FDA

IHA Beverage Issues a Voluntary Recall of Super Cinnamon Powder 4oz Because of Lead
Contamination | FDA

Also we need more livestock in some of the facilities. We are to issue more alerts of bird flu and
other diseases. Our people are in place to confiscate these animals on the way to being



slaughtered. Not all are slaughtered on site where the diseased animal has been diagnosed. We
will continue to use the resources of our news colleagues to ensure there are some reports of the
animals being put to death. You have your orders. They are to supersede any prior orders except
for those pertaining to the president and the president elect. Is that understood?" The whole room
shouted, "Yes sir." "Now get to work,” the man said quickly, then he turned and walked out of the
room.

Bird Flu Map Shows States Where H5N1 Has Spread - Newsweek

USDA Confirms Highly Pathogenic Avian Influenza in Backyard Non-Poultry Flock in Hawaii |
Animal and Plant Health Inspection Service

https://ag.utah.gov/2024/11/22/november-poultry-avian-flu-status-update/

Almost everyone is now sitting at a computer terminal working quickly on these orders. My eyes
focus on a tan skin man and his monitor screen. He is opening a file titled, "Food acquisition
request." Then it says, "Dairy." When it opens I see it’s a list of items like milk, cheese, sour
cream, butter, and such like things. He looks up for a moment from his screen to speak to the
white skin woman beside him. "I used mislabeling on the last milk recall. I wonder if our
so-called intelligent citizens would even notice if I send out another recall for the same reason?"
The woman spoke up, "Stuart you're not to draw attention to those items being recalled. You
know this having done this for several years now," she said firmly. He replied, "You're right
Miranda but every once in a while we are allowed to use a repetitive recall." Then my eyes were
drawn to another one's computer not far from these two. Displayed on his screen is a list of
names of influential people and elites from all over the world. The man on the screen has
selected each one. I realized he is sending out secure emails. Once they're sent I can see that the
email was titled, "Notice of upcoming auction."

I turned to look at another man working on his terminal. He is quickly typing up what looks like
requests or orders for food and other items for different locations, different bunkers. He stops for
a moment then speaks to another man next to him. "Geoffe, I'm sending you the items list of
those needing to be removed from the upper elite bunkers. We are to send them to stock the
underground cities in addition to the other we send. Only the freshest and best quality for those
above us." The man named Geoffe replied, "You got it Scott. As soon as I finish here I will start
on it. I'm finishing the notifying of our contacts inside the government, food, and product
industries. They all know what to do."

"What about their payment?" The man named Scott asked. "Staff sergeant Eckhardt will take
care of seeing that it's done. You focus on your own orders," Geoffe replied quickly. His stern
words silenced the man named Scott. The whole room was silent from conversation. As I watch
them send out order upon order for food and other items to be recalled I begin waking up out of
this dream. I had the understanding that the majority of recalls were in truth deceptive means for
needed or requested items to be pulled from our shelves that supply the general public population
to stock bunkers and facilities hidden within the grounds, waters, and anywhere else they choose
to stockpile them. And the majority will be out of use for the common ordinary people like me.
"Jesus Christ my love I'm so thankful I trust in You and not man, not the government to take care
of my family and me. Truly You are a good and faithful Savior and Friend. I love You Jesus
Christ, I love You." "I love you too daughter of Mine"



Verses

Luke 12: 16-21; Matthew 7: 7-12; Psalms 73: 11-12; Matthew 6:19-24; Psalms 37:9-19;
Matthew 7:24-29; Deuteronomy 7:9

“The mislabeling has been very effective too.” Quote from the dream.

Another recent prior food recall due to mislabeling.
11-12-24
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=LS2nsytuz1k
https://www.pennlive.com/food/2024/11/nearly-80000-pounds-of-costco-butter-have-been-recall
ed-but-youll-never-guess-why.html
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=d69-DCaG2ds

Updated 12-18-24





https://www.newsweek.com/illegally-imported-mexican-beef-tallow-fsis-alert-unfit-human-cons
umption-199096

https://www.newsweek.com/illegally-imported-mexican-beef-tallow-fsis-alert-unfit-human-consumption-199096
https://www.newsweek.com/illegally-imported-mexican-beef-tallow-fsis-alert-unfit-human-consumption-199096


https://www.allrecipes.com/international-delight-coffee-creamer-recall-oct-2024-8735874

https://foodchainmagazine.com/news/coffee-creamer-recall-joins-a-record-year-for-us-food-safet
y-recalls/
https://www.allrecipes.com/international-delight-coffee-creamer-recall-oct-2024-8735874

https://www.allrecipes.com/international-delight-coffee-creamer-recall-oct-2024-8735874*
https://www.allrecipes.com/international-delight-coffee-creamer-recall-oct-2024-8735874*
https://foodchainmagazine.com/news/coffee-creamer-recall-joins-a-record-year-for-us-food-safety-recalls/
https://foodchainmagazine.com/news/coffee-creamer-recall-joins-a-record-year-for-us-food-safety-recalls/
https://www.allrecipes.com/international-delight-coffee-creamer-recall-oct-2024-8735874


https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/atkinson-milling-company-re
calls-frozen-1-lb-bag-frozen-hushpuppies-onions-2-lb-8oz-bag-frozen

https://www.healthline.com/health-news/cucumbers-costco-eggs-recalled-salmonella#:~:text=Ac
cording%20to%20a%20food%20safety,may%20be%20contaminated%20with%20Salmonella

https://www.jacksonville.com/story/news/2024/10/17/ready-to-eat-chicken-recall-listeria-sold-pub
lix-walmart-target-products-list/75712930007/

https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/atkinson-milling-company-recalls-frozen-1-lb-bag-frozen-hushpuppies-onions-2-lb-8oz-bag-frozen
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/atkinson-milling-company-recalls-frozen-1-lb-bag-frozen-hushpuppies-onions-2-lb-8oz-bag-frozen
https://www.healthline.com/health-news/cucumbers-costco-eggs-recalled-salmonella#:~:text=According%20to%20a%20food%20safety,may%20be%20contaminated%20with%20Salmonella
https://www.healthline.com/health-news/cucumbers-costco-eggs-recalled-salmonella#:~:text=According%20to%20a%20food%20safety,may%20be%20contaminated%20with%20Salmonella
https://www.jacksonville.com/story/news/2024/10/17/ready-to-eat-chicken-recall-listeria-sold-publix-walmart-target-products-list/75712930007/
https://www.jacksonville.com/story/news/2024/10/17/ready-to-eat-chicken-recall-listeria-sold-publix-walmart-target-products-list/75712930007/


https://costco97.com/recall-readywise-emergency-food-supply-bucket/#google_vignette

https://www.foodindustrycounsel.com/recalls/year/2024
https://www.fsis.usda.gov/sites/default/files/food_label_pdf/2024-10/Recall-028-2024-Labels.pdf
https://wcrz.com/recall-of-frozen-meat-products/

https://www.cnn.com/2024/11/29/health/egg-recall-costco-salmonella/index.html

https://costco97.com/recall-readywise-emergency-food-supply-bucket/#google_vignette
https://www.foodindustrycounsel.com/recalls/year/2024
https://www.fsis.usda.gov/sites/default/files/food_label_pdf/2024-10/Recall-028-2024-Labels.pdf
https://wcrz.com/recall-of-frozen-meat-products/
https://www.cnn.com/2024/11/29/health/egg-recall-costco-salmonella/index.html


https://www.newsweek.com/egg-recall-sparks-warning-five-states-1992879

https://www.foodsafetynews.com/2024/11/food-recalls-in-the-u-s-spike-due-to-listeria-salmonella
-and-allergens/
https://www.yahoo.com/news/nationwide-recalls-cheese-coffee-creamer-010000824.html
https://www.newsweek.com/pasta-recall-fda-listeria-2000453
https://www.newsweek.com/pizza-recall-issued-multiple-states-over-contamination-concerns-20
00806
https://www.newsweek.com/raw-milk-recall-california-bird-flu-virus-contamination-1995514

https://www.newsweek.com/egg-recall-sparks-warning-five-states-1992879
https://www.foodsafetynews.com/2024/11/food-recalls-in-the-u-s-spike-due-to-listeria-salmonella-and-allergens/
https://www.foodsafetynews.com/2024/11/food-recalls-in-the-u-s-spike-due-to-listeria-salmonella-and-allergens/
https://www.yahoo.com/news/nationwide-recalls-cheese-coffee-creamer-010000824.html
https://www.newsweek.com/pasta-recall-fda-listeria-2000453
https://www.newsweek.com/pizza-recall-issued-multiple-states-over-contamination-concerns-2000806
https://www.newsweek.com/pizza-recall-issued-multiple-states-over-contamination-concerns-2000806
https://www.newsweek.com/raw-milk-recall-california-bird-flu-virus-contamination-1995514


https://www.eatingwell.com/cheese-sold-at-aldi-recalled-due-to-listeria-8739217
https://www.fox26houston.com/news/brie-cheese-recall-aldi-listeria-concerns-nov-5-2024.amp

https://www.newsweek.com/cucumber-recall-latest-map-salmonella-outbreak-1999810

https://www.eatingwell.com/cheese-sold-at-aldi-recalled-due-to-listeria-8739217
https://www.fox26houston.com/news/brie-cheese-recall-aldi-listeria-concerns-nov-5-2024.amp
https://www.newsweek.com/cucumber-recall-latest-map-salmonella-outbreak-1999810


https://www.cdc.gov/salmonella/outbreaks/cucumbers-11-24/investigation.html
https://www.cdc.gov/salmonella/outbreaks/cucumbers-11-24/index.html
https://www.today.com/health/broccoli-vegetable-recall-2024-e-coli-rcna182633
https://www.producebluebook.com/2024/12/06/more-companies-recall-products-connected-to-cu
cumber-outbreak/
https://www.eatingwell.com/soup-mix-recalled-undeclared-allergen-8744773
https://www.statesman.com/story/news/state/2024/11/27/fda-food-recalls-2024-list-november-e-c
oli-carrots/76485274007/
https://www.rttnews.com/3489369/cibus-fresh-recalls-autumn-turkey-sandwiches.aspx#:~:text=T
he%20recall%20involves%20CF/%20Autumn,manufactured%20in%20Lena%20manufacturing
%20facility.
https://keepfoodsafe.org/news/cibus-fresh-recalls/

https://www.fastcompany.com/91213088/waffle-recall-listeria-2024-publix-kodiak-full-list-product
s-brands-lot-numbershttps://www.freep.com/story/news/local/michigan/2024/11/25/sugar-foods-f
resh-gourmet-tortilla-strips-recall-michigan/76563172007/
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/grand-central-bakery-issues-
allergy-alert-undeclared-egg-u-bake-pie-crust-u-bake-apple-pie-u-bake
https://www.newsweek.com/brownie-recall-update-fda-risk-level-1998480
https://www.newsweek.com/spice-recall-update-fda-risk-level-con-yeager-1997288
https://www.newsweek.com/drinking-water-recall-update-two-warnings-end-1997058
https://www.newsweek.com/fda-corn-salsa-recall-classification-1997662
https://www.newsweek.com/chocolate-recall-allergies-cal-yess-farm-fda-2001013
https://www.newsweek.com/carrots-vegetable-recall-grimmway-farms-1993663
https://www.newsweek.com/fda-food-recall-bloody-mary-mix-undeclared-fish-soy-allergens-1998
981
https://www.newsweek.com/nationwide-mushroom-recall-listeria-enoki-maryland-2000276

https://www.cdc.gov/salmonella/outbreaks/cucumbers-11-24/investigation.html
https://www.cdc.gov/salmonella/outbreaks/cucumbers-11-24/index.html
https://www.today.com/health/broccoli-vegetable-recall-2024-e-coli-rcna182633
https://www.producebluebook.com/2024/12/06/more-companies-recall-products-connected-to-cucumber-outbreak/
https://www.producebluebook.com/2024/12/06/more-companies-recall-products-connected-to-cucumber-outbreak/
https://www.eatingwell.com/soup-mix-recalled-undeclared-allergen-8744773
https://www.statesman.com/story/news/state/2024/11/27/fda-food-recalls-2024-list-november-e-coli-carrots/76485274007/
https://www.statesman.com/story/news/state/2024/11/27/fda-food-recalls-2024-list-november-e-coli-carrots/76485274007/
https://www.rttnews.com/3489369/cibus-fresh-recalls-autumn-turkey-sandwiches.aspx#:~:text=The%20recall%20involves%20CF/%20Autumn,manufactured%20in%20Lena%20manufacturing%20facility
https://www.rttnews.com/3489369/cibus-fresh-recalls-autumn-turkey-sandwiches.aspx#:~:text=The%20recall%20involves%20CF/%20Autumn,manufactured%20in%20Lena%20manufacturing%20facility
https://www.rttnews.com/3489369/cibus-fresh-recalls-autumn-turkey-sandwiches.aspx#:~:text=The%20recall%20involves%20CF/%20Autumn,manufactured%20in%20Lena%20manufacturing%20facility
https://keepfoodsafe.org/news/cibus-fresh-recalls/
https://www.fastcompany.com/91213088/waffle-recall-listeria-2024-publix-kodiak-full-list-products-brands-lot-numbers
https://www.fastcompany.com/91213088/waffle-recall-listeria-2024-publix-kodiak-full-list-products-brands-lot-numbers
https://www.freep.com/story/news/local/michigan/2024/11/25/sugar-foods-fresh-gourmet-tortilla-strips-recall-michigan/76563172007/
https://www.freep.com/story/news/local/michigan/2024/11/25/sugar-foods-fresh-gourmet-tortilla-strips-recall-michigan/76563172007/
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/grand-central-bakery-issues-allergy-alert-undeclared-egg-u-bake-pie-crust-u-bake-apple-pie-u-bake
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/grand-central-bakery-issues-allergy-alert-undeclared-egg-u-bake-pie-crust-u-bake-apple-pie-u-bake
https://www.newsweek.com/brownie-recall-update-fda-risk-level-1998480
https://www.newsweek.com/spice-recall-update-fda-risk-level-con-yeager-1997288
https://www.newsweek.com/drinking-water-recall-update-two-warnings-end-1997058
https://www.newsweek.com/fda-corn-salsa-recall-classification-1997662
https://www.newsweek.com/chocolate-recall-allergies-cal-yess-farm-fda-2001013
https://www.newsweek.com/carrots-vegetable-recall-grimmway-farms-1993663
https://www.newsweek.com/fda-food-recall-bloody-mary-mix-undeclared-fish-soy-allergens-1998981
https://www.newsweek.com/fda-food-recall-bloody-mary-mix-undeclared-fish-soy-allergens-1998981
https://www.newsweek.com/nationwide-mushroom-recall-listeria-enoki-maryland-2000276


https://www.newsweek.com/carrots-vegetable-recall-grimmway-farms-1993663
https://www.today.com/today/amp/rcna175276
https://www.today.com/health/recall/chicken-recall-list-listeria-brucepac-rcna175276

https://www.allrecipes.com/green-onion-recall-salmonella-oct-2024-8731613

https://www.cbsnews.com/news/brucepac-recall-meat-poultry-listeria-trader-joes-kroger-usda-list
/
https://www.msn.com/en-us/money/companies/pizza-recall-issued-in-multiple-states-over-conta
mination-concerns/ar-AA1vRg7K
https://www.msn.com/en-us/foodanddrink/foodnews/hot-cocoa-recalled-in-30-u-s-states-due-to-p
resence-of-foreign-matter/ar-AA1vCqBJ
https://www.accessdata.fda.gov/scripts/ires/index.cfm?Product=210377
https://fox4kc.com/news/great-value-breakfast-food-products-recalled-due-to-plastic-contaminati
on/
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/riverside-natural-foods-inc-is
sues-voluntary-recall-select-madegood-granola-bar-products-over
https://www.fsis.usda.gov/recalls-alerts/fsis-issues-public-health-alert-ready-eat-frozen-chicken-p
roducts-imported-without-0
https://www.fsis.usda.gov/recalls-alerts/fsis-issues-public-health-alert-ineligible-pork-products-im
ported-ecuador

https://www.newsweek.com/carrots-vegetable-recall-grimmway-farms-1993663
https://www.today.com/today/amp/rcna175276
https://www.today.com/health/recall/chicken-recall-list-listeria-brucepac-rcna175276
https://www.allrecipes.com/green-onion-recall-salmonella-oct-2024-8731613
https://www.cbsnews.com/news/brucepac-recall-meat-poultry-listeria-trader-joes-kroger-usda-list/
https://www.cbsnews.com/news/brucepac-recall-meat-poultry-listeria-trader-joes-kroger-usda-list/
https://www.msn.com/en-us/money/companies/pizza-recall-issued-in-multiple-states-over-contamination-concerns/ar-AA1vRg7K
https://www.msn.com/en-us/money/companies/pizza-recall-issued-in-multiple-states-over-contamination-concerns/ar-AA1vRg7K
https://www.msn.com/en-us/foodanddrink/foodnews/hot-cocoa-recalled-in-30-u-s-states-due-to-presence-of-foreign-matter/ar-AA1vCqBJ
https://www.msn.com/en-us/foodanddrink/foodnews/hot-cocoa-recalled-in-30-u-s-states-due-to-presence-of-foreign-matter/ar-AA1vCqBJ
https://www.accessdata.fda.gov/scripts/ires/index.cfm?Product=210377
https://fox4kc.com/news/great-value-breakfast-food-products-recalled-due-to-plastic-contamination/
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https://www.fsis.usda.gov/recalls-alerts/fsis-issues-public-health-alert-ineligible-pork-products-imported-ecuador


https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/cal-yee-farm-llc-issues-allerg
y-alert-undeclared-milk-soy-wheat-sesame-fdc-6-and-almonds-snack
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/cal-yee-farm-llc-issues-allerg
y-alert-undeclared-milk-soy-wheat-sesame-fdc-6-and-almonds-snack#recall-announcement
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/palermo-villa-inc-issues-reca
ll-1728-connies-thin-crust-cheese-frozen-pizzas-due-possible-plastic
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/new-age-international-recalls
-enoki-mushrooms-due-potential-health-risk
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/resers-fine-foods-inc-recalls-
select-lots-sprouts-farmers-market-gyro-family-kits-due-potential
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/con-yeager-spice-company-i
ssues-allergy-alert-undeclared-soy-and-wheat-trail-bologna-meat-processing
https://www.newsweek.com/mushroom-recall-update-fda-sets-highest-risk-level-1996507
https://www.newsweek.com/hummus-recall-over-potential-foreign-objects-products-1994685
https://www.newsweek.com/cinnamon-roll-danish-recall-update-plastic-contamination-fda-19889
16
https://www.newsweek.com/chocolate-bar-recall-sparks-warning-8-states-1995733
https://www.newsweek.com/sauce-recall-update-fda-risk-level-1995438
https://www.newsweek.com/greens-recalled-listeria-contamination-1994630
https://www.newsweek.com/fruit-vegetables-recalled-possible-listeria-1993350
https://www.newsweek.com/food-recall-map-every-fda-warning-each-state-1993183
https://www.newsweek.com/boars-head-settlement-listeria-outbreak-1989591
https://www.newsweek.com/party-tray-recall-sparks-warning-7-states-1997079
https://www.newsweek.com/chicken-salad-fda-food-recall-8-states-1983711
https://www.newsweek.com/tortilla-recall-update-fda-sets-risk-level-undeclared-wheat-allergen-1
997505
https://www.newsweek.com/appetizer-recall-sparks-warning-8-states-1996444
https://www.newsweek.com/dessert-recall-update-fda-sets-highest-risk-level-1992948
https://www.newsweek.com/seafood-salad-recall-update-fda-risk-level-hannaford-1992294
https://www.newsweek.com/food-recall-zucchini-squash-pero-family-farms-1991742
https://www.newsweek.com/nationwide-meat-recall-expands-listeria-yu-shang-1990175
https://www.newsweek.com/chicken-pasta-recall-fda-risk-update-15-states-1990047
https://www.health.com/drinking-bottled-water-recall-8743706#:~:text=More%20than%20150%2
C000%20bottles%20of,2

These links were before the dream but appear to be related. One is an over 500 page PDf of a
wine recall and a vast amount of more water and other drinks.
https://www.fsis.usda.gov/sites/default/files/distro_list/2024-09/RC-023-2024-Retail-List.pdf
https://www.thetakeout.com/1712787/soda-recalls-affected-millions/
https://www.msn.com/en-us/health/nutrition/drinking-water-recall-full-list-of-companies-with-ongo
ing-warnings/ar-BB1nKifi
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https://drinkflowater.com/2024-plastic-water-bottle-recall-nearly-2-million-plastic-water-bottles-re
called-due-to-contamination-concerns/
https://www.thehealthy.com/food/news-bottled-water-recall-fda-risk-update-november-2024/
https://www.igmpi.ac.in/igmpiblog/newsletter?news=223#:~:text=The%20Coca%2DCola%20Co
mpany%2C%20situated,%2C%202024%2C%20is%20currently%20ongoing.
https://www.dailymail.co.uk/health/article-13502023/sodas-drinks-recalled-FDA-harmful-cancer-c
hemicals.html?ns_mchannel=rss&ns_campaign=1490&ito=1490
https://recalls-rappels.canada.ca/en/alert-recall/various-silk-and-great-value-brand-plant-based-r
efrigerated-beverages-recalled-due
https://www.fda.gov/safety/recalls-market-withdrawals-safety-alerts/snapchill-llc-recalls-canned-c
offee-products-due-potential-clostridium-botulinum
https://kisselpaso.com/coffee-recall-nationwide/
https://www.fda.gov/media/179493/download
https://6abc.com/post/apple-juice-recall-2024-walmart-expands-products-sold-aldi-bjs-walgreens
-due-elevated-arsenic-levels/15289777/#:~:text=newly%20expanded%20recall.-,Walmart,Penns
ylvania%2C%20Puerto%20Rico%20and%20Virginia.
https://www.newsweek.com/fda-recall-juice-products-youngstown-grape-distributors-1973485

https://www.today.com/health/recall/apple-juice-recall-2024-walmart-aldis-rcna170252
***Note: That’s a whole lot of apple juice which by the way can be used in place of iodine pills in
situations where one might be exposed to large doses of radiation. Such as in a mushroom
cloud type war. If the Lord Jesus Christ leads, then please do the research.*** )

Concerning # of animals/herds reported infected by bird flu
https://www.cdc.gov/bird-flu/situation-summary/index.html
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